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Climate Vulnerability and Adaptation Assessment of Cambodian Se-
condary Cities Project 

The project assessed the nature and 
spatial location of climate hazards, 
vulnerabilities, and risks in four Cambo-
dian cities, given current climate change 
projections and adaptive capacities. The 
project was implemented in the four citi-
es Battambang, Kampot, Kratie and Chh-
long where a climate vulnerability and 
adaptation assessment was performed. 
Based on the assessments, the project 
proposed cli-mate resilient investment 
packages. The proposed adaptation 

options fed into the feasibility study 
which was implemented in parallel. All 
work was undertaken to improve the 
resilience of the cities’ infrastructure and 
to strengthen their ability to manage 
disruption from climate change related 
and other natural hazards with a gender 
focus.

Master Plans proposals based on climate 
strategies was developed for all four 
Cities.
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Master Plans proposals based 
on climate strategies was devel-
oped for Kampot. 
.


